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Mahendra Wahyu Dewangga <mwd171@ums.ac.id> Sat, Jul 15, 2023 at 9:21 PM
To: Sekretariat FP <sekretariat@fizjoterapiapolska.pl>

Editor in chief
Journal of Fizjoterapia Polska
 
Chief Editor of Polska Fizjoterapia Journal:
 

We are very grateful if our article is given the opportunity to be published in the journal Fizjoterapia
Polska with the title of the article; “The Effect of Moderate and Low-Intensity Aerobic Exercise on
Lowering Blood Sugar”
Thus we can convey, we hope that the editors can consider our request. Here we attach the article file.

 
Regards,
 
Mahendra Wahyu Dewangga
Department of Physical Therapy
Faculty of Health Sciences
Universitas Muhammadiyah Surakarta
Surakarta, Jawa Tengah, Indonesia

The Effect of Moderate and Low-Intensity Aerobic Exercise.docx
79K
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To: Sekretariat FP <sekretariat@fizjoterapiapolska.pl>
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Mahendra Wahyu Dewangga <mwd171@ums.ac.id>

Article accepted
14 messages

Sekretariat FP <sekretariat@fizjoterapiapolska.pl> Tue, Sep 5, 2023 at 6:59 PM
To: Mahendra Wahyu Dewangga <mwd171@ums.ac.id>

Dear Mahendra Wahyu Dewangga,

 I hope this message finds you well. We are pleased to inform you that your article titled "The Effect of Moderate and
Low-Intensity Aerobic Exercise on Lowering Blood Sugar" with system number FPM860 has been accepted for
publication in Issue 4 of "Fizjoterapia Polska". This issue is set to be released by the end of October.

 Upon review, it has come to our attention that the manuscript will require language corrections for the English text.
The cost for preparation and print will amount to 980 PLN.

 If you agree to the aforementioned conditions, could you kindly inform us about your preferred method of payment for
the preparation costs? Would you like to proceed with a card payment, or would a bank transfer be more convenient
for you? If you opt for the bank transfer, please let us know in which currency you'd like to make the payment: PLN,
EUR, or USD.

 We appreciate your contribution to "Fizjoterapia Polska" and look forward to your prompt response.

 

Warm regards,

-- 
---
Dariusz Jasiński,
sekretarz redakcji Fizjoterapii Polskiej
Biuro: ul. Łaska 3/5 pok. 108, 95-200 Pabianice
tel. 692 468 257
www.fizjoterapiapolska.pl
sekretariat@fizjoterapiapolska.pl

Fizjoterapia Polska jest oficjalnym pismem Polskiego Towarzystwa Fizjoterapii

--

Dariusz Jasiński,
secretary of Fizjoterapia Polska
Office: ul. Łaska 3/5 pok. 108, 95-200 Pabianice, Poland
tel. +48 692 468 257
www.fizjoterapiapolska.pl
sekretariat@fizjoterapiapolska.pl

Fizjoterapia Polska is official journal of Polish Society of Physiotherapy
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Mahendra Wahyu Dewangga <mwd171@ums.ac.id> Tue, Sep 5, 2023 at 7:00 PM
To: "widi@uny.ac.id" <widi@uny.ac.id>
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Mahendra Wahyu Dewangga <mwd171@ums.ac.id> Wed, Sep 6, 2023 at 12:24 PM
To: Sekretariat FP <sekretariat@fizjoterapiapolska.pl>
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Editor in chief Journal of Fizjoterapia Polska

Thank you for the information, I am very happy to hear that my article has been accepted. We will immediately
complete the payment via bank transfer. I will make payment in USD.

Regards
Mahendra Wahyu Dewangga
[Quoted text hidden]

Sekretariat FP <sekretariat@fizjoterapiapolska.pl> Wed, Sep 6, 2023 at 3:58 PM
To: Mahendra Wahyu Dewangga <mwd171@ums.ac.id>

Dear Mahendra Wahyu Dewangga,

There are bank details:

Name: DJ Studio Dariusz Jasinski

Street: Bugaj 88 lok 48

Zip code: 95-200

City/Country: Pabianice, Poland

SWIFT: BREXPLPWMBK

Bank account number (IBAN/BIC) in USD: PL 02 1140 2004 0000 3112 1183 7574

Bank address: mBank S.A. FORMERLY BRE BANK S.A. (RETAIL BANKING) LODZ, Skrytka
pocztowa 2108, 90-959 Łódź 2

SORT CODE – 11402004

The content should include: Prepress – System No. FPM860.

Kind regards,

Dariusz Jasiński

W dniu 06.09.2023 o 07:24, Mahendra Wahyu Dewangga pisze:
[Quoted text hidden]

Mahendra Wahyu Dewangga <mwd171@ums.ac.id> Wed, Sep 6, 2023 at 5:23 PM
To: widi@uny.ac.id

---------- Forwarded message ---------
Dari: Sekretariat FP <sekretariat@fizjoterapiapolska.pl>
Date: Rab, 6 Sep 2023 15.58
Subject: Re: Article accepted
To: Mahendra Wahyu Dewangga <mwd171@ums.ac.id>
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Sekretariat FP <sekretariat@fizjoterapiapolska.pl> Wed, Sep 6, 2023 at 7:25 PM
To: Mahendra Wahyu Dewangga <mwd171@ums.ac.id>

27/06/24, 08.59 Universitas Muhammadiyah Surakarta Mail - Article accepted

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=3aaca98d3e&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1776198827334639408&simpl=msg-f:1776198827334… 2/5

mailto:sekretariat@fizjoterapiapolska.pl
mailto:sekretariat@fizjoterapiapolska.pl
mailto:mwd171@ums.ac.id


Dear Mahendra Wahyu Dewangga,

I forgot to write: 980 PLN = 235 USD.

Kind regards,
Dariusz Jasiński

--- Treść przekazanej wiadomości ---
Temat:Re: Article accepted

Data:Wed, 6 Sep 2023 10:58:30 +0200
Nadawca:Sekretariat FP <sekretariat@fizjoterapiapolska.pl>

Adresat:Mahendra Wahyu Dewangga <mwd171@ums.ac.id>
[Quoted text hidden]
[Quoted text hidden]

Mahendra Wahyu Dewangga <mwd171@ums.ac.id> Fri, Sep 8, 2023 at 12:35 PM
To: Sekretariat FP <sekretariat@fizjoterapiapolska.pl>

Dear Chief Editor: 
Fizjoterapia Polska Journal

September 08, 2023

We notify the chief editor of the journal Fizjoterapia Polska, that we have made a transfer via bank
(CIMB Niaga) on September 08, 2023 with reference code: MB08090479721639 
Here we attach proof of the transfer. 

Im sorry before, I have a question for the editor regarding my article which was published in the 3rd
edition of the journal this year, with the title "THE IMPACT OF KNEE PAIN ON BODY BALANCE AND
ELECTROMYOGRAPHIC ACTIVITY OF THE QUADRICEPS MUSCLE IN FENCERS DURING THE
LUNGE MOVEMENT". Until now, my article is not available for download. I hope that my article can be
completed soon and published on the journal website so that it can be downloaded by the public. 
https://fizjoterapiapolska.pl/en/article/wplyw-bolu-kolana-na-rownowage-ciala-i-aktywnosc-
elektromiograficzna-miesnia-czworoglowego-u-szermierzy-podczas-ruchu-wypadu/  

Regards

Dr. Mahendra Wahyu Dewangga
[Quoted text hidden]
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Mahendra Wahyu Dewangga <mwd171@ums.ac.id> Tue, Sep 26, 2023 at 10:46 AM
To: Sekretariat FP <sekretariat@fizjoterapiapolska.pl>

Dear Chief Editor: 
Fizjoterapia Polska Journal

Good morning from Indonesia. I Hope you are doing well. I'm sorry, I have a question for my submission. Is the galley
proof of the article I submitted available? I hope I can read the galley proof before it is published at the beginning of
October.
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Thank you

Regards
Dr. Mahendra Wahyu Dewangga
[Quoted text hidden]

Mahendra Wahyu Dewangga <mwd171@ums.ac.id> Wed, Sep 27, 2023 at 10:44 AM
To: Sekretariat FP <sekretariat@fizjoterapiapolska.pl>

Dear Chief Editor: 
Fizjoterapia Polska Journal

Good morning from Indonesia. I Hope you are doing well. I'm sorry, I have a question for my submission. Is the galley
proof of the article I submitted available? I hope I can read the galley proof before it is published at the end of October.

Thank you

Regards
Dr. Mahendra Wahyu Dewangga
[Quoted text hidden]

Sekretariat FP <sekretariat@fizjoterapiapolska.pl> Fri, Sep 29, 2023 at 2:28 PM
To: Mahendra Wahyu Dewangga <mwd171@ums.ac.id>

Dear Dr. Mahendra Wahyu Dewangga

I should have gallery proof on Monday or Tuesday, I will send you it immediately.

Kind regards,
Dariusz Jasiński

W dniu 27.09.2023 o 05:44, Mahendra Wahyu Dewangga pisze:
[Quoted text hidden]

Sekretariat FP <sekretariat@fizjoterapiapolska.pl> Fri, Sep 29, 2023 at 5:09 PM
To: Mahendra Wahyu Dewangga <mwd171@ums.ac.id>

Dear Dr. Mahendra Wahyu Dewangga

I am attaching the gallery proof of article, please write me if you have any remarks.

Kind regards,
Dariusz Jasiński

W dniu 27.09.2023 o 05:44, Mahendra Wahyu Dewangga pisze:
[Quoted text hidden]
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Mahendra Wahyu Dewangga <mwd171@ums.ac.id> Fri, Oct 6, 2023 at 9:50 AM
To: Sekretariat FP <sekretariat@fizjoterapiapolska.pl>

Dear Chief Editor Fizjoterapia Polska

Thank you for the opportunity given to us. There are some things that need to be improved, but they are not
significant. In table 1, in the low intensity and moderate intensity sections in the pre test and post test amount columns
there are errors in both. The correct thing is that in the low intensity column the pre test amount is 163.3 and the post
test is 114.5. Meanwhile, in the moderate intensity column, the pre-test amount is 118.4 and the post-test is 94.9.
We hope that this section can be corrected before being officially published in your journal.
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Thank you, I hope the journal editor and his staff are in good health.

Greetings
Dr. Mahendra Wahyu Dewangga
[Quoted text hidden]

Sekretariat FP <sekretariat@fizjoterapiapolska.pl> Thu, Oct 19, 2023 at 7:02 PM
To: Mahendra Wahyu Dewangga <mwd171@ums.ac.id>

Dear Author,

Please check it now.

Kind regards,

Dariusz Jasiński

W dniu 06.10.2023 o 04:50, Mahendra Wahyu Dewangga pisze:
[Quoted text hidden]
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Mahendra Wahyu Dewangga <mwd171@ums.ac.id> Sun, Oct 22, 2023 at 8:26 PM
To: Sekretariat FP <sekretariat@fizjoterapiapolska.pl>

Dear Chief Editorial Fizjoterapia Polska

Thank you for the opportunity to me. Following up on the article that was sent to me, there is no improvement and
please post it on your website.
Once again, thank you.

Regards
Dr. Mahendra Wahyu Dewangga
[Quoted text hidden]
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